
BID PC17-06 AGGREGATE ROAD MATERIALS
NOVEMBER 4, 2016

Type A, Type A, Type B, Type B, Type F PB 3 PB 4 PB 5 Coarse Manufactured Gabian Shot run Rip Rap

Grade 4 Grade 5 Grade 4 Grade 5 Grade 7 Coverstone Coverstone Coverstone Screenings Sand (4" to 8") rock (8-12")

NAME/ADDRESS Topping Rock Topping Rock Topping Rock Topping Rock Topping Rock

APAC-Texas, Inc. Delivered Price

PO Box 224048 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Dallas, TX 75222-4048 F.O.B. Plant Price

srmcconathy@texasbit.com
217-741-3531

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only 29.75$        33.75$        29.75$        33.75$        26.75$        49.75$     49.75$        55.75$        19.25$        21.75$        20.00$     

PO Box 40 Leach Pit No bid No bid
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price 18.00$        22.00$        18.00$        22.00$        15.00$        38.00$     38.00$        44.00$        7.50$          10.00$        5.50$       

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only

PO Box 40 Richards Pit No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only 26.50$        26.50$        18.00$        19.50$        15.50$     25.50$         

PO Box 40 Springfield Quarry No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price 18.00$        18.00$        9.50$          10.50$        5.50$       15.50$         

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Vulcan Construction Materials Delivered Price

545 E. John Carpenter #950 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Irving, TX 75062 F.O.B. Plant Price 21.00$        21.00$        45.00$     42.00$        11.00$        9.00$          21.00$        

keithp@vmcmail.com
469-904-4540

37 Mining, LLC Delivered Price

3133 Ranger Hwy. No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Weatherford, TX 76088 F.O.B. Plant Price 17.00$        17.00$        8.00$          16.00$        

kboyd@37bp.com
817-901-6553

Imex Innovative Co. Delivered Price 29.00$        17.00$        20.00$        21.00$        26.00$        39.00$     49.00$        55.00$        19.00$        21.00$        21.00$        19.00$     22.00$         

5811 SW 88th St.
Miami, FL 33156 F.O.B. Plant Price

imexinnovativeco.gmail.com

786-973-0100



BID PC17-06 AGGREGATE ROAD MATERIALS
NOVEMBER 4, 2016

NAME/ADDRESS

APAC-Texas, Inc. Delivered Price

PO Box 224048
Dallas, TX 75222-4048 F.O.B. Plant Price

srmcconathy@texasbit.com
217-741-3531

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only

PO Box 40 Leach Pit 
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only

PO Box 40 Richards Pit
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only

PO Box 40 Springfield Quarry
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Vulcan Construction Materials Delivered Price

545 E. John Carpenter #950
Irving, TX 75062 F.O.B. Plant Price

keithp@vmcmail.com
469-904-4540

37 Mining, LLC Delivered Price

3133 Ranger Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76088 F.O.B. Plant Price

kboyd@37bp.com
817-901-6553

Imex Innovative Co. Delivered Price

5811 SW 88th St.
Miami, FL 33156 F.O.B. Plant Price

imexinnovativeco.gmail.com

786-973-0100

Rip Rap Rip Rap Rip Rap Type A, Type A, Special

(12-18") (18-24") (24-36") Grade 1 Grade 4 1" Base Chat Reject Base Patching Cushioned Type B Type C Type D
Flex Base Flex Base Materials Sand HMAC HMAC HMAC

65.00$       65.00$       69.00$       

No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
54.00$       54.00$       58.00$       

19.25$       18.25$     18.75$     21.25$       15.25$       106.75$       26.75$       74.25$       74.25$       74.25$       

No bid No bid No bid
7.50$         6.50$       7.00$       9.50$         3.50$         95.00$         15.00$       62.50$       62.50$       62.50$       

15.50$     16.00$     

No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
6.50$       7.00$       

25.50$         22.50$         23.00$         15.00$     15.50$     17.00$       11.00$       

No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
15.50$         12.50$         12.50$         6.50$       7.00$       8.50$         2.50$         

No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
9.50$         8.50$       9.00$       53.00$       55.00$       

No bid No bid No bid Decordova No bid No bid No bid
21.00$         23.00$         7.50$         7.00$       7.00$       5.00$         8.00$         

22.00$         22.00$         20.00$         6.00$         6.00$       18.00$     20.00$       15.00$       100.00$       25.00$       73.00$       73.00$       73.00$       



BID PC17-06 AGGREGATE ROAD MATERIALS
NOVEMBER 4, 2016

NAME/ADDRESS

APAC-Texas, Inc. Delivered Price

PO Box 224048
Dallas, TX 75222-4048 F.O.B. Plant Price

srmcconathy@texasbit.com
217-741-3531

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only

PO Box 40 Leach Pit 
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only

PO Box 40 Richards Pit
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only

PO Box 40 Springfield Quarry
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Vulcan Construction Materials Delivered Price

545 E. John Carpenter #950
Irving, TX 75062 F.O.B. Plant Price

keithp@vmcmail.com
469-904-4540

37 Mining, LLC Delivered Price

3133 Ranger Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76088 F.O.B. Plant Price

kboyd@37bp.com
817-901-6553

Imex Innovative Co. Delivered Price

5811 SW 88th St.
Miami, FL 33156 F.O.B. Plant Price

imexinnovativeco.gmail.com

786-973-0100

Demurrage Charges
Type B Type D Type FF Type B Type D Select Other Per Gallon
WMAC WMAC HMCL HMCL HMCL Fill Materials Min. Time / Per Hr Rate

65.00$       69.00$       81.00$       81.00$       81.00$       101.00$                              1 hour

No bid $90/hr.
54.00$       58.00$       70.00$       70.00$       70.00$       90.00$                                

74.25$       74.25$       15 min.

No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $100/hr.
62.50$       62.50$       

15 min.

No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $100/hr.

15 min.

No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $100/hr.

1 hr.

No bid No bid No bid No bid Fine "D" Rock $95/hr.
70.00$       70.00$       8.00$                                  

1 hr. 

No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid Gravel - Decordova $80/hr.
7.00$         12.00$                                

73.00$       73.00$       2 hr.

$75/hr.



BID PC17-06 AGGREGATE ROAD MATERIALS
NOVEMBER 4, 2016

NAME/ADDRESS

APAC-Texas, Inc. Delivered Price

PO Box 224048
Dallas, TX 75222-4048 F.O.B. Plant Price

srmcconathy@texasbit.com
217-741-3531

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only

PO Box 40 Leach Pit 
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only

PO Box 40 Richards Pit
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Zack Burkett Delivered Price - Pct. 1 only

PO Box 40 Springfield Quarry
Graham, TX 76450 F.O.B. Plant Price

MEllis@ZackBurkettCo.com
940-549-0436

Vulcan Construction Materials Delivered Price

545 E. John Carpenter #950
Irving, TX 75062 F.O.B. Plant Price

keithp@vmcmail.com
469-904-4540

37 Mining, LLC Delivered Price

3133 Ranger Hwy.
Weatherford, TX 76088 F.O.B. Plant Price

kboyd@37bp.com
817-901-6553

Imex Innovative Co. Delivered Price

5811 SW 88th St.
Miami, FL 33156 F.O.B. Plant Price

imexinnovativeco.gmail.com

786-973-0100

Comments Piggyback

Freight Schedule

Pct. 1 Rock $7.34 / HMA $8.30
Pct. 2 Rock $6.40 / HMA $7.34

Pct. 3 Rock $3.57 / HMA $4.07
Pct. 4 Rock $6.40 / HMA $7.40

Haul Rate Schedule

Pct. 1 $8.40/ton
Pct. 2 $8.05/ton

Pct. 3 $6.83/ton
Pct. 4 $6.30/ton

Hauling/Trucking Company

Does not sell aggregate road materials

YES

YES

YES

YES

Yes

YES

YES



  

 

 
 

 

APAC‐Texas, Inc.  



11/4/2016 PC17-06 Agg Road Mat. Price Submittal Form.docx

file:///C:/Users/KA8F5~1.RIV/AppData/Local/Temp/PC17-06_Agg_Road_Mat._Price_Submittal_Form_6738550-1.htm 1/2

PC17-06
Submittal: 11/04/16

 
 
Having read and understood the instructions, terms, conditions, specifications and invitation to bid, we submit the
following bid:
 

FORMAL BID PC17-06 AGGREGATE ROAD MATERIALS & RELATED PRODUCTS
PRICE SUBMITTAL FORM

 
 Per ton bid price Per ton bid price
 F.O. B. Plant Site Delivered
1. Type A. Grade 4 Topping Rock $ No Bid $ No Bid
2. Type A, Grade 5 Topping Rock $ No Bid $ No Bid
3. Type B, Grade 4 Topping Rock $ No Bid $ No Bid
4. Type B, Grade 5 Topping Rock $ No Bid $ No Bid
5. Type F, Grade 7 Topping Rock $ No Bid $ No Bid
6. PB 3 Coverstone $ No Bid $ No Bid
7. PB 4 Coverstone $ No Bid $ No Bid
8. PB 5 Coverstone $ No Bid $ No Bid
9. Coarse Screenings $ No Bid $ No Bid
10. Manufactured Sand $ No Bid $ No Bid
11. Gabian (4” to 8”) $ No Bid $ No Bid
12. Shot run rock $ No Bid $ No Bid
13. Rip Rap (8-12”) $ No Bid $ No Bid
14. Rip Rap (12-18”) $ No Bid $ No Bid
15. Rip Rap (18-24”) $ No Bid $ No Bid
16. Rip Rap (24-36”) $ No Bid $ No Bid
17. Type A, Grade 1 Flex Base $ No Bid $ No Bid
18. Type A, Grade 4 Flex Base $ No Bid $ No Bid
19. 1” Base $ No Bid $ No Bid
20. Chat $ No Bid $ No Bid
21. Reject Base $ No Bid $ No Bid
22. Special Patching Material $ No Bid $ No Bid
23. Cushioned Sand $ No Bid $ No Bid
24. Type B HMAC $ 54.00 $ 65.00
25. Type C HMAC $ 54.00 $ 65.00
26. Type D HMAC $ 58.00 $ 69.00
27. Type B WMAC $ 54.00 $ 65.00
28. Type D WMAC $ 58.00 $ 69.00
29. Type FF HMCL $ 70.00 $ 81.00
30. Type B HMCL $ 70.00 $ 81.00
31. Type D HMCL $ 70.00 $ 81.00
32. Select Fill $ No Bid $ No Bid
33. Other Materials $ 90.00 $ 101.00

 
 
 
Demurrage charges:
 
Minimum time limit: 1 hourPer hour rate: $ 90.00
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In signing this bid page for formal bid #PC17-06, the undersigned is obligated to all the instructions, terms,
conditions and specifications set forth in the pages of this document.  The undersigned further agrees to provide
the County any and all invoices it may require for pricing verification under this contract.
 
 
WOULD BIDDER BE WILLING TO ALLOW OTHER GOVERNMENTAL ENTITIES TO PIGGYBACK OFF
THIS CONTRACT, IF AWARDED, UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS?:
 

YES  NO
 
 

 
Bidder's Name and Address:
APAC-Texas Inc
 
 
Name: Steve McConathy
 
Signature: Steve McConathyDate: 11-4-2016
 
Telephone: 214-926-9031
 
 



  

 

 
 

 

Zack Burkett  











  

 

 
 

 

Vulcan Construction Materials  









  

 

 
 

 

37 Mining, LLC 



11/4/2016 PC17-06 Agg Road Mat. Price Submittal Form.docx

file:///C:/Users/KA8F5~1.RIV/AppData/Local/Temp/PC17-06_Agg_Road_Mat._Price_Submittal_Form_6738550.htm 1/2

PC17-06
Submittal: 11/04/16

 
 
Having read and understood the instructions, terms, conditions, specifications and invitation to bid, we submit the
following bid:
 

FORMAL BID PC17-06 AGGREGATE ROAD MATERIALS & RELATED PRODUCTS
PRICE SUBMITTAL FORM

 
 Per ton bid price Per ton bid price
 F.O. B. Plant Site Delivered
1. Type A. Grade 4 Topping Rock $ 17.00 $ See Attachment
2. Type A, Grade 5 Topping Rock $ No Bid $
3. Type B, Grade 4 Topping Rock $ 17.00 $
4. Type B, Grade 5 Topping Rock $ No Bid $
5. Type F, Grade 7 Topping Rock $ No Bid $
6. PB 3 Coverstone $ No Bid $
7. PB 4 Coverstone $ No Bid $
8. PB 5 Coverstone $ No Bid $
9. Coarse Screenings $ No Bid $
10. Manufactured Sand $ 8.00 $
11. Gabian (4” to 8”) $ 16.00 $
12. Shot run rock $ No Bid $
13. Rip Rap (8-12”) $ No Bid $
14. Rip Rap (12-18”) $ No Bid $
15. Rip Rap (18-24”) $ 21.00 $
16. Rip Rap (24-36”) $ 23.00 $
17. Type A, Grade 1 Flex Base $ 7.50 $
18. Type A, Grade 4 Flex Base $ 7.00 $
19. 1” Base $ 7.00 $
20. Chat $ No Bid $
21. Reject Base $ 5.00 $
22. Special Patching Material $ No Bid $
23. Cushioned Sand $ 8.00 $
24. Type B HMAC $ No Bid $
25. Type C HMAC $ No Bid $
26. Type D HMAC $ No Bid $
27. Type B WMAC $ No Bid $
28. Type D WMAC $ No Bid $
29. Type FF HMCL $ No Bid $
30. Type B HMCL $ No Bid $
31. Type D HMCL $ No Bid $
32. Select Fill $ 7.00 $
33. Other Materials $ 12.00 $

 
 
 
Demurrage charges:
 
Minimum time limit: 1 HourPer hour rate: $ 80.00
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In signing this bid page for formal bid #PC17-06, the undersigned is obligated to all the instructions, terms,
conditions and specifications set forth in the pages of this document.  The undersigned further agrees to provide
the County any and all invoices it may require for pricing verification under this contract.
 
 
WOULD BIDDER BE WILLING TO ALLOW OTHER GOVERNMENTAL ENTITIES TO PIGGYBACK OFF
THIS CONTRACT, IF AWARDED, UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS?:
 

YES  NO
 
 

 
Bidder's Name and Address:
37 Mining LLC 
3133 Ranger Hwy 
Weatherford, Tx, 76088
 
 
Name: Kevin Boyd
 
Signature: Kevin BoydDate: 11-03-2016
 
Telephone: 817-901-6553
 
 





  

 

 
 

 

IMEX Innovative Co. 



PC17-06
Submittal: 11/04/16

Having read and understood the instructions, terms, conditions, specifications and invitation to bid, we submit the
following bid:

FORMAL BID PC17-06 AGGREGATE ROAD MATERIALS & RELATED PRODUCTS
PRICE SUBMITTAL FORM

Per ton bid price Per ton bid price
F.O. B. Plant Site Delivered

1. Type A. Grade 4 Topping Rock $ $ 29
2. Type A, Grade 5 Topping Rock $ $ 17
3. Type B, Grade 4 Topping Rock $ $ 20
4. Type B, Grade 5 Topping Rock $ $ 21
5. Type F, Grade 7 Topping Rock $ $ 26
6. PB 3 Coverstone $ $ 39
7. PB 4 Coverstone $ $ 49
8. PB 5 Coverstone $ $ 55
9. Coarse Screenings $ $ 19
10. Manufactured Sand $ $ 21
11. Gabian (4” to 8”) $ $ 21
12. Shot run rock $ $ 19
13. Rip Rap (8-12”) $ $ 22
14. Rip Rap (12-18”) $ $ 22
15. Rip Rap (18-24”) $ $ 22
16. Rip Rap (24-36”) $ $ 20
17. Type A, Grade 1 Flex Base $ $ 6
18. Type A, Grade 4 Flex Base $ $ 6
19. 1” Base $ $ 18
20. Chat $ $ 20
21. Reject Base $ $ 15
22. Special Patching Material $ $ 100
23. Cushioned Sand $ $ 25
24. Type B HMAC $ $ 73
25. Type C HMAC $ $ 73
26. Type D HMAC $ $ 73
27. Type B WMAC $ $ 73
28. Type D WMAC $ $ 73
29. Type FF HMCL $ $
30. Type B HMCL $ $
31. Type D HMCL $ $
32. Select Fill $ $
33. Other Materials $ $

Demurrage charges:

Minimum time limit: 2Per hour rate: $ 75

In signing this bid page for formal bid #PC17-06, the undersigned is obligated to all the instructions, terms, conditions
and specifications set forth in the pages of this document.  The undersigned further agrees to provide the County any
and all invoices it may require for pricing verification under this contract.

WOULD BIDDER BE WILLING TO ALLOW OTHER GOVERNMENTAL ENTITIES TO PIGGYBACK OFF THIS
CONTRACT, IF AWARDED, UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS?:

https://www.bidsync.com/DPX/tx/pc?ac=supterms&view=view&auc=2...
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YES  NO

Bidder's Name and Address:
Imex Innovative co
5811 sw 88th st Miami 33156

Name: Jose Jaramillo

Signature: Jose JaramilloDate: 10/27/2016

Telephone: 7869730100

https://www.bidsync.com/DPX/tx/pc?ac=supterms&view=view&auc=2...
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